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Port of San Francisco Announces Katie Petrucione as New Chief Financial Officer 
 
San Francisco, CA — The Port of San Francisco announced today that Katie Petrucione is the 
new Chief Financial Officer of the Port of San Francisco.  Katie will begin working for the Port in 
April. 
 
“Katie’s past professional experience and 17 years serving our San Francisco residents and 
visitors makes her an outstanding candidate to serve the Port’s diverse stakeholders,” said 
Elaine Forbes, Executive Director of the Port of San Francisco. “I am confident she will help us 
sustain the Port’s economic vitality and diversity, continue to manage our finances with 
discipline, and successfully help us deliver seismic and capital improvements to keep our 
waterfront safe for our future generations.” 
 
Katie has worked for the City and County of San Francisco for 17 years.  She worked for the 
Recreation and Park Department since 2004 and has completed 13 budgets during her time 
with the Department.  Under Katie’s leadership at the Recreation and Park Department, she 
crafted Proposition B that created a funding baseline and $15 million in annual funding to 
address deferred maintenance for San Francisco parks.   Prior to her employment at the 
Recreation and Park Department, she held position in the Mayor’s Office of Finance and 
Legislative Affairs and in the Office of the Honorable Barbara Kaufman, a member of the Board 
of Supervisors.  Before her tenure with the City, Katie worked in the private sector for three 
research firms from 1991 to 1997.  She holds a Master of Public Affairs degree from the 
University of Texas.   
 
Katie was born and raised in San Francisco. She lives in the southwest corner of the City with 
her husband, Paul, and an orange cat. 
 
The Port of San Francisco is responsible for the seven and one-half miles of San Francisco 
waterfront adjacent to the San Francisco Bay, which the Port develops, markets, leases, 
administers, manages, and maintains. Its jurisdiction stretches along the waterfront from Hyde 
Street Pier on the north to India Basin on the south. 
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